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013001-LB01C013A: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Move around head and heart of 
embryo resting within womb. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB01C013B: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Pull out from BCU eye to heart. 
Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB01C014A: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Hold on head. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB01C015: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Rotate around limb buds. Dorsal 
view. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB01C016A: Model of 4 week human embryo.. Silicone with beating heart. Rotate around limb buds. Dorsal 
view. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB01C016B: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Move in  to heart. Ventral view. 
Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB03C016: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. BCU track up umbilical chord to limb 
bud. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB03C017: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Wide track around body with focus 
on the umbilicus connecting to placenta. Track is around dorsal surface. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB03C018: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Hold over dorsal surface of body 
with focus on the umbilical chord connecting to placenta.  Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB04C063A: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Move from heart to eye to rear 
limb bud. Left side. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB04C063B: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Move from leg limb bud to heart. 
Left side.Mid shot. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB04C063D: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Move from eye to beating heart. 
Mid shot. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB04C065A: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Move rear limb bud to front limb 
bud. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB04C065C: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Wide rotating move from head to 
view over rear limb bud towards head. Finally track in towards heart and head. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB04C066: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. CU track from and to from arm limb 
bud. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB04C067: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Rotate around head from head end . 
Arm limb bud and heart visible. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB04C068A: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Rotate around head from head 
end . Track over  Arm  and leg limb buds. Heart visible. CU. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB04C068B: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Rotate around head from head 
end . Hold over heart and arm limb bud. Heart visible. CU. Endoscopic Lighting 

013001-LB05C017: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Wide rotate around embryo. Dark 
Field Backlighting 



013001-LB05C018: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. CU move into heart with rotation. 
Dark Field Backlighting 

013001-LB05C019: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Mid shot rotate around embryo over 
body in profile to dorsal view and view from back of body. Small zoom. Dark Field Backlighting 

013001-LB05C020: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Zooms in and out of whole embryo 
with CU track to head at the end. Dark Field Backlighting 

013001-LB05C021: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. Close up move over developing 
head and spinal chord Profile. Dark Field Backlighting Shot reversed in motion.

013001-LB06C006: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. VBCU beating heart. Profile Dark 
Field Backlighting 

013001-LB06C007: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. BCU head. Move onto eye. Dark 
Field Backlighting 

013001-LB06C008: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. CU beating heart. Ventral view. Dark 
Field Backlighting 

013001-LB06C009: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. CU beating heart. Ventral view. Dark 
Field Backlighting 

013001-LB06C011: Model of 4 week human embryo. Silicone with beating heart. CU beating heart. Profile view. Dark 
Field Backlighting 


